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1 Directions:
1. Print both pages on 
cardstock or photo paper.
2. Cut out both the top and 
bottom circles
3. Cut out the three gray 
notches in the top circle
4. Cut out a small card-
board square from a cereal 
box or other thin cardboard
5. Put the top circle on top 
of the bottom circle, then 
put the cardboard square 
in the center on the back 
(for stability)
6. Push a tack or push pin 
through the center circle 
on top all the way through 
the cardboard
7. Either pound the pin  
down sideways with a 
hammer, or if using a push 
pin, put an eraser over top. 
An eraser from a mechani-
cal pencil works great.
8. Spin the top wheel to 
see number triads. Practice 
addition or subtraction 
facts by placing a thumb 
over one of the numbers.
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